
 
 

5 Tips to Refresh your Home for Summer 

As the temperatures rise and the days get longer, it's the perfect time to refresh your home 
for the summer season. Whether you're looking to create a cool oasis indoors or enhance 
your outdoor living space, these five tips will help you achieve a stylish and inviting home 
that's perfect for summer!  

Lighten Up Your Color Palette: One of the easiest ways to give your home a summer 
makeover is by lightening up your color palette. Opt for soft, airy hues like pale blues, 
greens, and yellows to create a sense of freshness and lightness in your space. Consider 
incorporating pops of color with accessories like throw pillows, rugs, and artwork for a 
cheerful touch. 

Bring the Outdoors In: Say hello to nature by bringing elements of the outdoors into your 
home. Incorporate natural materials like wood, rattan, and wicker into your decor to create 
a warm and organic feel. Consider adding fresh flowers and plants to brighten up your 
space and add a touch of greenery. 

  

Create Comfortable Outdoor Living Spaces: Make the most of the warmer weather by 
creating comfortable outdoor living spaces where you can relax and entertain. Invest in 
durable outdoor furniture like lounge chairs, dining sets, and umbrellas to create a 
functional and inviting outdoor oasis. Don't forget to add cozy throws, cushions, and 
outdoor rugs for added comfort and style. 



Update Your Textiles: Swap out heavy winter textiles like wool blankets and velvet curtains 
for lighter, breezier options like linen, cotton, and sheer fabrics. Opt for lightweight 
curtains that allow natural light to filter in and keep your space feeling bright and airy. 
Consider updating your bedding with crisp white linens and lightweight duvets for a fresh 
and summery look. 

Add Seasonal Accessories: Add the finishing touches to your summer-ready home with 
seasonal accessories that reflect the carefree spirit of the season. Incorporate nautical 
touches like striped pillows, rope accents, and coastal artwork for a beachy vibe. Consider 
adding playful accessories like woven baskets, lanterns, and decorative shells to enhance 
the summertime feel. 

Refreshing your home for summer is simple and can easily create an inviting space that's 
perfect for relaxing, entertaining, and enjoying the season to the fullest. So go ahead, 
embrace the laid-back vibes of summer and give your home the seasonal makeover it 
deserves! 

If you’re considering home staging or interior design, please keep us in mind. We are now 
booking for summer! 

 

            
              Hire the team that truly INSPIRES! 

INSPIRING HOMES STAGING AND DESIGN 
www.inspiringhomesstagingdesign.com 

PHONE: 321.261.6934 
EMAIL: info.inspiringhomes321@gmail.com 

 

 


